ITB-003-08/EM GROUP A GROUP B GROUP C GROUP D
Supplier Name S3-6f S2 TOTAL| S2 TOTAL| S2 TOTAL| S2 TOTAL
Aluise and Associates, Inc. 11.2|| 45.05 56.25| 52.69 63.89| 54.73 65.93]| 55.20 66.40
|Baywood Technologies Inc. 22.2| 45.93 68.13|| 46.44 68.64/ 48.75 70.95[| 49.32 71.52
|Business Technology Group, Inc. 16.6|| 42.94 59.54| 47.17 63.77|] 49.09 65.69| 51.58 68.18
CanDoTech Consulting, Inc. 12.0| 37.47 49.47| 43.27 55.27|| 43.37 55.37| 43.77 55.77
ICIBER, Inc 23.8|| 57.57f 81.37| 59.84] 83.64| 61.47| 85.27| 65.25/ 89.05
Coleman Technologies, Inc. 11.0]f 40.20 51.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
JCOMSYS 23.6f 53.11 76.71| 56.91] 80.51| 61.47| 85.07|| 58.54| 82.14
Consulting Soultions International 8.0 40.89 4889 48.09 56.09|| 48.09 56.09| 49.32 57.32
|ICyberBest Technology, Inc. 20.8|f 59.47f 80.27|| 55.85 76.65 62.01 82.81]] 60.78 81.58
IDES of Florida, LLC 16.6|| 47.85 64.45| 4899 65.59| 54.37 70.97|| 52.58 69.18
|[E-Consuilting, Inc. 14.8| 44.30 59.10|| 48.82 63.62| 47.12 61.92 46.55 61.35
[EMTEC 19.6/| 69.75/ 89.35| 50.99 70.59|| 66.84 86.44| 61.02 80.62
|[Etchasoft, Inc. 17.2| 57.10 74.30|| 49.11 66.31f 54.58 71.78|f 53.76  70.96
[Everest Solutions, LLC 16.2| 40.70 56.90|| 44.09 60.29|| 50.49 66.69| 48.94 65.14
|Geysers International Inc 13.6| 52.51 66.11)| 50.84 64.44|f 51.98 65.58| 51.86 65.46
|HAS, Inc. 19.2|| 48.81 68.01ff 55.85 75.05| 57.47 76.67|| 57.83 77.03
ICBM Corporation 21.6|f 47.36 68.96|f 49.17 70.77| 56.55 78.15| 52.29 73.89
Information Systems of Florida, Inc. 23.0| 4192 6492 4v.17 70.17| 47.12 70.12| 47.71 70.71
Interactive Resources, LLC 18.6|] 52.71 71.31 No Bid 58.91 77.51)| 57.49 76.09|
JISOCORP, Inc. 19.2| 52.94 72.14| 54.27 73.47| 60.29 79.49| 6252} 81.72
|astech Inc. 13.4)| 51.93 65.33| 53.02 66.42| 59.40 72.80|f 5872 72.12
[Kelly IT Resources 17.8|| 41.37 59.17|| 46.96 64.76|| 47.12 64.92|| 47.48 65.28
[Materials Software System Inc. 17.4) 38.27 55.67|] 43.55 60.95| 44.99 62.39| 4434 61.74
[Millennium Technology Inc 172 3955 56.75 No Bid No Bid 45.44  62.64
[MPS Group Inc 20.2|| 49.93 70.13|f 43.73 63.93|| 48.75 68.95| 49.83 70.03
[INAZTEC INTERNATIONAL GROUP 21.8| 5109 7289 49.51 7131 53.15 7495 53.46 75.26
INu Info Systems, Inc. 20.4|f 53.85 74.25 54.12 7452 52.75 73.15| 58.19 78.59|
Omni-Source Inc. 19.4| 4459 63.99|| 4837 67.77|| 50.13 69.53| 51.58 70.98
OMSYS Services, Inc. 18.0f 47.68 65.68 No Bid No Bid 54.07 72.07
|Pearsonality 144 39.83 54.23|| 43.07 57.47| 4560 60.00f 44.63 59.03
[Platforms Technologies, LLC 14.0| 48.42 62.42|| 5090 64.90| 58.89 72.89| 59.97 73.97
|Pomer0y IT Solutions 19.0|| Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive Non-Responsive
[RAD GOV Inc 19.6|| 42.17 61.77|| 43.82 63.42 43.63 63.23| 46.78 66.38
[Robert Half Technology 14.8|| 43.69 58.49| 47.52 62.32| 48.67 63.47|| 49.05 63.85
|[ROI Consulting Group, Inc. 17.6|| Non-Responsive 48.29 65.89| 48.30 65.90| 4841 66.01
Sapphire Technologies 20.0ff 54.82 74.82|| 43.91 63.91]f 52.36 72.36|| 56.26 76.26
Seva Technologies, LLC 21.0]] 48.63 69.63| 56.02 77.02|| 55.22 76.22|| 56.47 77.47
SGS Technologie LLC 282 51.09 79.29|f 51.46] 79.66| 45.02 73.22|| 56.63] 84.83
Skillstorm, Inc. 17.6| 39.90 57.50| 43.90 61.50 44.54 62.14| 46.29 63.89
SMX 18.6|| 44.30 62.90|| 47.96 66.56|| 48.09 66.69| 48.07 66.67
Snelling Staffing Services 13.6]] 55.65 69.25| 64.23] 77.83| 6454 78.14| 65.17 78.77
Software House International 18.2| 41.37 59.57|| 47.49 65.69| 47.76 65.96| 48.20 66.40
Software Integration Services 30.0ff 70.00f 100.00ff 70.00{ 100.00f 70.00; 100.00| 70.00/ 100.00
Software Resources, Inc. 21.8| 52.16 7396/ 55.26 77.06| 61.47 83.27|| 59.83 81.63
Spherion Corporation 19.2|| 5853 77.73|] 56.91 76.11]] 62.01 81.21) 56.47 75.67
Staffing Providers Inc. 19.0|| Non-Responsive Non-Responsive 43.24  62.24|| Non-Responsive
Strategic Staffing Solutions 21.6f 40.28 61.88|f 43.04 64.64|f 48.05 69.65| 47.35 68.95
Synergy Software Solutions 26.6)| 52.90, 79.50| 58.63] 85.23|| 63.64 90.24| 65.66/ 92.26
Systel Inc. of Delaware 20.6)| 42.95 63.55| 44.95 65.55| 47.44 68.04 46.49 67.09
T2 Software Services, Inc. 18.8|] 51.78 70.58|| 48.24 67.04| 55.79 7459 57.18 75.98
TAC Worldwide Companies 18.0] 50.43 68.43|| 4593 63.93|| 56.55 74.55| 56.47 74.47
Technisource 228l 41.62 64.42|| 4456 67.36 46.20 69.00| 47.71 70.51
TEKsystems 194 57.27 76.67|| 51.74 71.14| 54.02 73.42|| 56.82 76.22
The Matlen Silver Group 16.4| 38.08 54.48|| 43.68 60.08| 44.18 60.58|| 44.59 60.99
\V/2Soft, Inc. 13.8| 41.30 55.10| 46.39 60.19|| 50.13 63.93| 4759 61.39
Visual Solutions Inc. 226 43.75 66.35 48.71 71.31| 47.12 69.72| 49.57 72.17
Volt Services Group 22.6|| 62.37f 84.97 No Bid 60.42 83.02|] 57.53 80.13




